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YOUTH NATION DESTINY 

A recession looms. Across the 
country, Australia’s productive 

workers and families are on the 
chopping block of “the economy”. 

This god, who governs all, must be 
fed with the people’s blood. And 

indeed, the Canberra politicians are 

falling over themselves to meet up 
with their counterparts in the New 

World Order Inc. to ensure that the 
system itself survives. They may 

now permit some “re-regulation” of 
the economy, slow down the re-

moval of all tariff barriers lest too 
many jobs be lost, let the govern-

ment guarantee the banks so as to 

“bail them out”, use the Treasury 
power to generate some employ-

ment through spending and so on. 
Why the new deal? Why the same-

type policies of the 1930’s New 
Deal era of the United States, the 

same policies of John Keynes, the 
economists’ saint who pioneered 

deficit spending to save (sic) the 

Western regimes from the Great 
Depression - seventy years ago? 

 
The system called capitalism has 

got out of hand; so, its own organ-
ised common administration com-

mittee, which we will call for con-
venience, “the state”, must now 

govern for all capitalists and rescue 

the system. Yet, to some free mar-
ket true-believers, these same 

servants of the multinationals and 
the international banks are betray-

ing the ‘truth’ that heaven-on-earth 
comes only when there is a com-

plete free market of people and 

goods. As if the system of banks and 
multinationals is actually a “free 

market”! In reality, the new deal is a 
shift inside the regime. There cannot 

be too much chaos, too much gam-
bling with futures, too much Stock 

Exchange speculation, too much 

greed.  
 

If these negative aspects of capital-
ism rule the day, the system itself 

might crash – and the unholy Aus-
tralian people might just work to-

wards creating a very different eco-
nomic and social order! 

 

The Class War Of The Rich 
 

For a long period, Australia has seen 
a class war in operation, one waged 

not from below, but from above. 
Australia is governed by a traitor 

class, a class of both money (big 
shareholders, owners, landlords) 

and management (media bosses, 

upper civil servants, politicians etc) 
which recognises no real loyalty to 

Australia. Its loyalty is to the “global 
economy”, to the consortium of 

global banks and multinationals 
which see Australia as a branch of-

fice of the global economy, the New 
World Order. 

 

We need not deal with the history of 
this class, but Blind Freddie knows it 

has a long history, back into the co-
lonial period and through the days of 

‘all-the-way-with-the-USA’ invest-
ments and wars. There came a mo-

ment after the electoral victory of 

Malcolm Fraser in 1975, when glob-
alism became the watchword, when 

this class cut off its last moorings to 
Australia. It is at home in New York 

or Tokyo as it is in Melbourne – and 
its loyalties are likewise.  

 

When it became clear that globalism 
was the system’s way forward 

(1970”s), much had to change in 
Australia. Government owned facili-

ties had to be “privatised”.  Tariffs 
were to be scrapped. Australian 

owned manufactures and farms 
were the first targets (1970’s – 

1980”s) of the traitor class. The sys-

tem has always been big on 
“reports” and “reforms”. Each has 

seen an industry choke to death and 
foreigners usurp control. For exam-

ple, Aussie family farms have shrunk 

in number; others have been cor-
poratised, or integrated into serv-

ing foreign owned food companies! 
Labour was the next target as wag-

es were held back and the unions 
taken over by open ALP-loyal hacks 

- and now labour is to be squeezed 

absolutely. As things went on, 
workers had to be denied the right 

to be in free trade unions, so un-
ions were attacked under the guise 

that there were corrupt union boss-
es. Labour would ultimately negoti-

ate its price as a workplace agree-
ment. And if the Australian worker 

didn’t like it, there happened the 

threat of cheaper foreign labour - 
“Section 457 Visa” labour. 

 
Of late, it is people who are operat-

ing  shops, small    Con’t p. 2 

Anybody Who Is Against The White  

Australia Policy Is Against The  

Australian Nation - Jack Lang 
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Australian workers, farmers, small business and other  

patriotic working people must act against globalism …. 
 

Truck owners and drivers and builders’ labourers now 

in the forefront of resistance: 
 

Australia First To Build Unity In Struggle  

Without  truckies, Australia stops. Owner drivers invest heavily in 
their livelihood. And for miserable rates of pay! 
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small service industries and busi-
nesses, who have become the tar-

gets. As John  Farrell of the Nation-
al Federation of Independent Busi-

ness puts it, small business and 

their families are a trillion dollar as-
set, there to be looted. Enter then – 

Australia’s truckies and families, 
owner-drivers and their employees. 

 
The fundamental aim of traitor class 

capitalism is to seize control of the 
private enterprise sector, the only 

sector where anything like a 

“market” operates, but one where 
families are participating directly in 

creating wealth and are the most 
vulnerable. 

 
Truck Owners And Drivers Rise 

To Fight! 
 

The targeting of Australia’s truckies 

is part of the class war of the traitor 
class. The basic aim is to put the 

owner-drivers out of business and 
allow a few large transport compa-

nies – Lin Fox, Tolls (Patricks), TNT, 
K and S Freighters and so on, to 

dominate the field. The ALP toady 
union, the Transport Workers’ Un-

ion (TWU), is so far in the pocket of 

the government that it is regarded 
with contempt by workers and own-

er-drivers alike; the TWU implicitly 
supports the destruction of small 

operators. Indeed, the TWU invests 
in Toll Holdings! 

 
To destroy the small businesses 

that sustain countless Aussie fami-

lies, a trick has been employed. 
This trick is called a “reform”, one 

ostensibly put in place to ensure 
safety in the industry – to ensure 

the drivers are always rested and 
so forth. 

 
However, ‘Bunny’ Brown, president 

of the Australian Long Distance 

Owners’ And Drivers’ Association 
(ALDODA) says that the govern-

ments have “made up a new law”. 
He says that the system of new log 

books is impossible to manage and 
the hours can be difficult to organ-

ise when long distance driving is 
involved. It is “a method to revenue

-raise”, to crush owner-drivers.  

 
Fines, stops, waste of time with in-

spections and records’ keeping 
have pushed people to the wall. 

With police steered towards fining 
owner drivers and not drivers for 

the big companies, with Roads of-
ficers targeting them for minor 

breaches of the rules, a lot of “real 

experience is being driven out of 
the industry”. 

 
For ‘Bunny’ and another truckie (we 

will call him ‘Ted’) from Blacktown,  

Drugs, Despair, Deliverance: Oper-
ation Osterley,  by seasoned patri-

ot, Perry Jewell, is a must-read for 
all parents with a drug dependent 

child, or for all young people chal-
lenged by drugs. It makes a strong 

call for war on the drug criminals, 

for parental rights over young ad-
dicts  and for a new strategy to 

cure the scourge. Price: $20 from 
P.O. Box 7799 Mail Centre Too-

woomba 4351 
 

 Australia First promotes this book. 

being an owner-driver is not a job, 
but a craft, a  “lifestyle”. Ted said 

that the job now “was not a physi-
cal job, it’s a mental job, a night-

mare”. Too many rules! It was clear 
to both Bunny and Ted that the big 

companies were prepared to em-

ploy “cheap contract labour from 
overseas” to beat the owner-drivers 

out of their profession – and ulti-
mately even to replace the native 

Aussie workforce in the big outfits. 
 

On July 28 2008, workers and own-
er-drivers supported a National 

Shutdown. The truckies raised a 

raft of demands, including: 
 

The return  of the old “log book” for 
drivers, abolition of fines for tech-

nical breaches of rules, fines only 
for safety breaches not other log 

book breaches, better rest areas, 
more consideration for professional 

drivers on demerit points, no in-

creases on fuel excise. 
 

Across Australia, truckies demon-
strated and took a few days off. 

They held meetings and pressed 
demands. Sadly, the whole industry 

did not shut down, the TWU be-
trayed the workers, the govern-

ment stonewalled. Media falsely 

said truckies called for “violence”. 
 

The long fight for justice will contin-
ue. To preserve their businesses 

and families, truckies have vowed 
to continue their actions. 

 
Building Workers Fight Back 

 

The construction industry was, from 
the start of “Work Choices” (under 

John Howard, but still not all re-
pealed under Rudd), a prime target 

for what is called “reform”. The en-
try of the foreign workers (Section 

457 Visa entrants) was part of this 
“reform”. 
 

One building worker wrote to Aus-
tralia First last month and said:  “I 

have been involved in the construc-
tion industry for some years now. I 

have had the opportunity to witness 
first-hand the impact which migrant 

workers, particularly of Asian origin, 

have directly on the daily operation 
of our modern work sites. While 

some employers opt for the less 
expensive decision to employ for-

eign workers who will carry out 
their tasks for less pay, work longer 

hours and complete work hastily, in 
turn creates severe OHS and 

productivity issues concerning the 

overall safety of all.” 
 

The main union, the ‘CFMEU’’ has in 
the past made noises about foreign 

contract labour, but it has stayed 
within the orthodoxy of the human 

rights industry that, as long as 

they are paid the same money, it’ll 
be alright. It isn’t. As a super-

union, the TWU has become a large 
machine out of touch with the 

workers. It is a matter of job dis-
placement. Aussie workers leave an 

industry or an area, the contract 

labour moves in. Skills are lost. 
Then the state and its media pro-

claim the foreign workers are 
“necessary”. 

 
The building worker added:  

“The Asian workers do not care 
about Australia. They do not care 

about the health and safety of oth-
ers in the workplace. They do not 

bother to learn fluent English. They 
do not bother to try and understand 

how to communicate with Australi-
an workers. They form their own 

communities and own social circles 

and do not care to be part of a big-
ger picture.  They use Australia and 

the job opportunities for their own 
purposes. They give nothing back in 

return. Some use us to bring their 
brothers, cousins, friends and fami-

lies to Australia so they can further 
use Australia’s land to their own 

advantage. They don’t care about 

assimilating into Australian society, 
they only care about themselves.” 

 
Amazingly, a report commissioned 

last April by the KRudd government 
and lauded up in an editorial in the 

Sydney Morning Herald (Nov.16), 
said that the scheme, which now 

involves 58,000 workers, has 

“served” Australia. Served who? 
 

A Programme For Action For 
Truckies And Building Workers! 

 
Australia First Party has said to 

truckies and activist groups like 
ALDODA that it is important to link 

up with general community con-

cerns on related issues and thereby 
deepen the movement. 

 
1. Australia First will campaign for:  

 
The nationalization of all tollways 

and the abolition of the tolls; a na-
tional fuel industry and a national 

fuel price (no world parity pricing); 

the development of cheaper fuels; a 
total review of the revenue-raising 

system for all motorists’ and truck-
ies’ traffic and parking fines, with 

lesser penalties, warnings in place 
of some fines and the reduction in 

the numbers of people wastefully 
employed in issuing them and polic-

ing the system; the elimination of 

red tape bureaucracy in all areas of 
the trucking industry; to lobby local 

councils to upgrade truckies’ facili-
ties. 

 
By encouraging workers, by elimi-

nating wasteful revenue-raising, by 
stimulating an industry, we expect 

higher efficiencies and productive 

output. It is here, in fairly taken 
taxation, that government can real-

robbing the producers!? 

 
Australia First Party has issued ma-

terials to building workers. 
 

2. Australia First will campaign for: 

 
The abolition of foreign contract la-

bour; the abolition of workplace 
agreements and the return to cen-

tral wage fixing; the return of the 
right to strike. 
 

These points shall be worked for as 
community action policies and 

translated into election policies. 
 

It is surely time for ordinary Aus-
tralians to stand united against the 

forces of globalisation and fight to 

at least retain jobs and professions 
and sustain families. It shall be a 

long road to an Australian economy 
run by Australians and it will be 

along time before the New World 
Order system (despite current 

problems) can be disposed of. Yet, 
the nationalists are resolved as the 

world situation alters and conditions 

in Australia change, so will develop 
the true cause of Australian identi-

ty, independence and freedom. 
____________________________ 

 

CLASSIC AUSSIE TEXTS BY 

FRANK ANSTEY, MP 
 

The Kingdom Of Shylock and The 
Money Power explained the rise of 

finance capital in the early 20th 
Century. What is money? How is it 

created by private banks? 
 

Go to the Nationalist Archive at 
www.alphalink.com.au/~radnat  

A testament to struggle: truckies won once; they will win again. 



The New Zealand Nationalist Alli-
ance (NA) invited the Australia First 

Party to participate in Flag Day 
(October 25). The NA is an alliance 

of the nationalist forces in that 
country, featuring the New Zealand 

National Front (NF), the National 

Democrats, the New Right and oth-
er social and music groups. 

 
Flag Day was organized directly by 

the Wellington branch of the Na-
tional Front. 'Vince' the key organ-

izer, revealed himself a veritable 
dynamo. He liaised with the police, 

established the security for the 

march and set up a camping venue 
for the out-of-town nationalists.  

 
On the Day itself, some 40 or so 

nationalists who were staying at a 
Lower Hutt caravan park, assem-

bled at a nearby railway station, 
where by arrangement, they were 

met by police. They took the 

train to Wellington's main station 
with a police escort, arriving about 

11.15 am. Here they were met by 
additional activists and further po-

lice. The marchers assembled 
quickly, unfurled the flags and then 

marched to Parliament House. 
 

A raft of two dozen or so NZ flags 

were carried aloft, along with two 
essential Aussie icons: the Australi-

an National Flag and the Southern 
Cross. A large blue/red National 

Front banner led the way. 
 

A counter-demonstration was tout-
ed for weeks. Ultimately, just under 

70 nationalists were confronted by 

About Audacity 
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‘That which failed to destroy us, 
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Subscription: Audacity will be 
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pay Australia First Party. 

 

Our logo is the Janus head im-
posed upon the Southern Cross. 

This Roman god looked back-

wards and forwards, binding 

past, present and future  
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. now threatens the European basis 
of both countries, the destruction of 

our jobs and communities through 
free trade, all demand a united re-

sponse”. 
 

The Flag Day had attracted the 

leading NZ nationalists from the 
various cities of the country. They 

were later able to meet in confer-
ence and other meetings and de-

cide how to advance the movement  
overall.  Jim Saleam met privately 

with Kerry Bolton of Renaissance 
Press and Kyle Chapman of Nation-

alist Alliance to discuss key ques-

tions.  He was also able to confer 
with Mr. Ansell and talk informally  

 

e

 
 the regime’s position. The regime 

of Washington / New York is not 

“Western” but alien, a travesty up-
on Occidental  (Western) values. 

This is said, whether or not in the 
past, some pasty-faced ‘white boy’ 

used to be its President. The re-

gime will now seek the aggressive 
opening of all borders and the for-

mal multiculturalisation of all Euro-
pean societies. 

 
Those Australian pseudo patriots 

who used to prattle on about their 
“ally” in America need to get a grip 

on reality. A cursory Internet 

search will confirm that it is the 
Russian Federation in fact which 

remains the principle defender of 
all ethnic and racial identities, and 

in particular, it is the focal point for 
the white racial nationalist move-

ments. We know that because of 
the open and state sponsored fo-

rum held in Moscow in 2007, enti-

tled Russia And The White World.  
 

But, and we say this stridently, 
America promulgates one model, a 

New World Order in her own like-
ness, whilst Russian leaders  prom-

ulgate a multipolar world where all 
races and peoples can create their 

own identities, each to their own 

kind and friendships suitable to 
each. Leading patriots from all over 

the world were present at that con-
ference and welcomed the multipo-

lar model against that of America. 
What was it Henry Lawson said? 

“The vanguard of the white man is 
the vanguard of the Rus”. 

 The Washington / New York regime 
has its nuclear weapons and its 

conventional forces and thus it re-
veals itself. as a First World power, 

yet it is a second rate nothing 
country via its election of a Third 

World President. Like the days of 

ancient Egypt and Rome an utter 
alien has acceded to the nominal 

Emperor’s  role. Indeed, as the Chi-
nese proverb goes: "we live in in-

teresting times". 
  

And Australia will survive its' time! 

“And in the end a mulatto sat upon 

the throne of the Pharaohs.” (Major 
Ernest Sevier Cox, White America, 

1923, a prophetic book available on 
the Internet.) 

 

The American empire recently 
elected Barack Obama, a ‘black’ 

man, as President. Yet he is not a 
Negro (a term the multiculturalist 

PC American media no longer uses 
in any case to describe black per-

sons descended of the original slave 
population), but is more properly 

called an “African American”, a son 

of a Kenyan immigrant and a white. 
What does all this signify? 

 
The American State no longer rep-

resents a nation. The old white 
American nation (which had certain 

sub-minorities like Indians and Ne-
groes who originally did not deter-

mine its basic cultural direction) is  

now a prisoner within an empire, 
dispossessed and without power; 

this empire is one, not just of di-
verse peoples, but also of a money 

elite. When we call this state an 
empire, we mean it! It is an empire 

which seeks to extend its realm of 
the liberal mind and corporate and 

banking power throughout the 

world. Its slogans are “democracy”, 
“opportunity”, “equality”. 

 
So what will change in America? 

 
The new President will essentially 

maintain the US presence in Iraq 
for some time, (years in fact),  will 

escalate the war in Afghanistan and   

First World Power, Second Rate Country, Third World 

President: Barack Obama — Cold Truth 

New Zealand Flag Day Rally, October 25: Developing The ANZAC 

Link Will Build The Movement On Both Sides Of The Tasman 

may invade Iran. The connection 
with Israel will obviously remain 

because these are Israel's 'policies'. 
These policies will also ensure the 

power of the Zionist lobby in Amer-
ican politics. Internally however, 

there will be an attempt to centre 

the regime of the banks and the 
corporations upon ethnic minorities 

(sic) who may have things to gain 
and upon the more liberal  ‘guilt-

ridden’ sections of US whites.  
 

Policies will also be drafted like 
those of President Roosevelt’s days 

in the 1930’s to appeal to “main 

street” – mortgage relief, job crea-
tion etc.  Of course, powerful 

groups like Obama’s main contribu-
tor, Goldman Sachs bank, will not 

be disturbed. And ominously, 
Obama will bust open the border 

with Mexico to create a huge free 
trade zone, amnestise millions of 

illegal immigrants and send Ameri-

ca’s ‘white majority’ on the path to 
absolute minority status. All this 

will be done because the Establish-
ment wants it done. We add too 

the appointment of endless num-
bers of known Zionists, some of 

whom were Busheviks, into a new 
administration of national (sic) rec-

onciliation.  

 
We will see an attempt to promote 

the globalist and multiculturalist 
propaganda agenda more intense-

ly, using the black face of the Presi-
dent more assertively. In reality, 

the new American empire has only 
formalised what was already  

xactly 34 anarchists!  For the ex-
treme left in Wellington, this was a 

severe defeat! Considering that a 
few years before, hundreds of left-

ists had attacked the Flag day 
marchers, this year, tells a whole 

new story. Today, these anarchists 

are f ina l ly -  demoral ised . 
 

Outside the old nineteenth century 
Parliament  building, the rally com-

menced. Onlookers also joined in. 
The NF secretary, Mr. Colin Ansell, 

spoke. He was followed by Mr. Ste-
ve Larsen of New Right. They said 

that New Zealand had pride in the 

Flag first raised in 1869 and made 
the national symbol in 1902. It 

honoured the war dead; it united 
modern (not just colonial) New 

Zealanders. Given that Flag Day is 
not generally celebrated in New 

Zealand, its use by the nationalists 
as a festival of Kiwi identity and 

heritage, is most creditable. 

 
Jim Saleam of Australia First said:  

 
“I represent the Australia First Party 

which is in  solidarity with the Alli-
ance and its affiliate-parts. We 

bring Flag Day our greetings. On 
April 25 this year, ANZAC Day ex-

actly six months ago, the two or-

ganizations adopted the ANZAC 
Declaration. We later authored an 

ANZAC Manifesto. These documents 
set out to explain that the two 

countries face similar dangers and 
will share a common evil fortune, 

unless they rebuild the old ANZAC 
The rise of Chinese imperialism and 

the immigration nightmare that   

with many individual nationalist ac-
tivists, particularly those involved 

in the National Front. Crucial intelli-
gence on the NZ anarchist rabble 

and their links to Australian Labor 
Party connected “anti racists”, was 

exchanged. Some of this involved 

attempts to direct  ‘our own’ anar-
chists against Australia First and 

other patriotic people  
 

It was important to the Australia 
First  Party to develop these politi-

cal and personal links with the New 
Zealand nationalists. Australian na-

tionalists were invited to the 2009 
Flag Day.  It is planned that a delega-
tion shall attend. 



Australia First close to registration numbers, shows 

its’ electoral potential, ready for growth in 2009 

Where To Find Australia First 
National Contact Line:  
02 8587 0014 

 

New South Wales: 

 

Australia First (NSW) office: P.O. 

Box 593 Rockdale 2216 
Blue Mountains: P.O. Box 202 

Katoomba 2780 

Western Sydney: P.O. Box 200 

Emerton 2770 

Newcastle: P.O. Box 482 The 
Junction 2291; 0420 351 216 

Coffs Harbour: 0419 492 917 

Sutherland Shire: P.O. Box 2499 

Taren Point 2228 ; 0407 732 868 

Other locations to be advised.  

Australia Wide: 
 

Australia First (Toowoomba):  

P.O. Box 103 Crows Nest 4355 

Australia First (Brisbane): P.O. 

Box 2173 Graceville East 4075 

 
Australia First (Western Austral-

ia): P.O. Box 129 Collie 6225 

Australia First (Victoria): P.O. 

Box 223 Croydon 3136 

 
Adelaide, Perth  and other lo-

cales to be advised. 

 

National committee e-mail: 

ausfirst@alphalink.com.au 

Inverell Forum:  
www.inverellforum.org 

 

Patriotic Youth League:   

www.patrioticyouthleague.info 
I 

Independent nationalist Resources 

 

Australian Nationalist Ideological 

Historical And Legal Archive: 

www.alphalink.com.au/~radnat 

 
Nativist nationalists:   

www.alphalink.com.au/~eureka 
 

National Independent magazine (on 
line):  http://rogerhnsw.tripod.com/ 

‘Australia First’ Web Sites 
 

Australia First Party Resources  

 
New South Wales:  http://

ausfirst.alphalink.com.au 

Queensland:  

www.australiafirst.info 

Newcastle:   
www.freewebs.com/afnewcastle 

Melbourne: 

www.australiafirst.net 

Truth Television:   
http://209.85.102.130/~truthtel/   

 
Special  Independent  

Nationalist Organisations 

 

Sydney Forum:  

www.sydneyforum.net 

The Eight Core Policies Of Australia First:  

A Programme And A Method 
Whatever will benefit Australia, that we are for; whatever will harm Australia, that we are against. William Lane 
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Immigration mistakes can be big long term 
mistakes. Immigration policy must take into  
account social cohesion, employment opportu-
nities, urbanisation and environmental issues 
 
5 Abolish Multiculturalism 
 
End the divisive, government funded and insti-
tutionalised policy of multiculturalism. 
 
6  Introduce Citizen's Initiated Referenda 
 
Amend the Australian Constitution such that 
the people can initiate a constitutional referen-
dum which, if approved by the Australian peo-
ple, will amend the Australian Constitution. 
This simple step will confirm the political au-
thority of voters and make legislators aware 
that they are the servants of the Australian 
People, not their masters. The people directly 
should also possess the sovereign right and 
the power to initiate other legislation 
 
7. Strengthen the family 
 
Promote policies that strengthen and protect 
the traditional family. 
 
8  Strive to Rebuild A United Australia 
 
Promote policies that recognise the interde-
pendence of city and country. 
 

9  Democratise Other Policy Issues  
 

All other policies (non-core policies) are mat-
ters of free conscience and are not binding 
upon Australia First’s future parliamentarians  
or councillors who are to represent their elec-
torates.  
 
Issues of public interest on which Australia 
First needs to formulate policy will be can-
vassed with the party membership and plebi-
scites conducted where deemed appropriate 
by the party’s National Council. The party also 
permits branches to formulate specific elec-
toral policies or community policies not incon-
sistent with the Eight Core Policies. 
 

From time to time, the party will issue materi-
al that provides interpretation of the core poli-
cies. This interpretative material would reflect 
the spirit of the party. 
 
The organizational purpose for this statement 
of policy and system for policy creation is sim-
ple: Australia First does not require weighty 
tomes, which change from month to month, 
as do the programmes of  the Establishment 
parties and those who ape them. It requires a 
focus for action and for unity within the party. 
 
Australia First is to build a new national move-
ment. Practicality is method. 

The potential for Australia First was 
demonstrated in the September 

2008 Councils’ poll in New South 
Wales. 

 
Australia First Party tickets polled 

5.62% in Blacktown and 4% in the 

Sutherland Shire. Good starts were 
also made in Newcastle and Coffs 

Harbour. 
 

These results overshadowed the 
One Nation Federal averages of 

1.8% in the 2007 poll. 
 

The Federal registration of the Aus-

tralia First Party (NSW) Incorpo-
rated, our full organizational title as 

appears on our membership forms, 
will open a new chapter in the Aus-

tralian nationalist and patriotic 
struggle. 

The unfolding of a major recession 
of the globalist economy, the un-

likelihood of any real immigration 
cut, the breakdown of social stabil-

ity in Australia both via economic 
crisis and the ravages of multicul-

turalism—all suggest that Australi-

ans will increasingly offer national-
ists a hearing. 

 
“In 2009, Australia First will experi-

ence a membership surge and de-
velop physical structure in several 

key areas of the country”, a mem-
ber of the national committee said 

to Audacity! “We will be working 

closely with sections of Real Aus-
tralia to fight back against the 

globalisers’ system. Many people 
who are prepared to struggle will 

find their way to us”. Take your 
place in Australia First! 

 

 

The core policies of Australia First are the ba-
sis of association of the party. They are (with 
explanations) as follows: 
 
 
1 Ensure Australia Retains Full Independence 
 
Protect our sovereignty (national, constitu-
tional and personal) and maintain an ade-
quate defence, whilst being reasonable and 
fair in our nation's international dealings. 
 
2 Rebuild Australian Manufacturing Industries 
 
This is the only way we can be self sufficient. 
It will provide jobs for our children, and help 
buy back the farm and allow Australia to be 
free of foreign debts. Our infrastructure has 
been run down over many years - it must be 
rebuilt. We must improve the practicality and 
relevance of our educational systems, and 
target government support for industry to di-
versify, innovate, perform and expand. We 
recognise that small business is fundamental 
to this policy. A satisfactory financial environ-
ment is also urgent and essential. 
 
3 Control Foreign Ownership 
 
Bring foreign ownership and investment back 
under control. 
 
4 Reduce and Limit Immigration 

The ANZAC Declaration: 
Australia First Party And New Zea-

land Nationalist Alliance: 
Declaration Of Common Interests 

And Future Relations 
April 25 2008 

 

 

 The Australia First Party is moving 
decisively towards having the base 

numbers to support an application for 
its Federal registration as a political 

party. 
 

The party’s national management 

committee set December 3 2008, Eu-
reka Stockade Day, as the date for 

the collection of the necessary signed 
membership forms for the purposes of 

the Australian Electoral Commission. 
 

Of course, in registering a party,  Aus-
tralia First’s  leadership states that its 

purposes are to acquire the appropri-

ate legal status and rights and privi-
leges. This does not mean that Aus-

tralia First considers its purposes to be 
restricted to electoral work. Quite the 

contrary. Australia First operates the 
three tier method of political action:  

participation in Federal and other 
elections, especially local elections; 

community, grassroots and public 
and street activities; work that devel-

ops the party’s ideological quality, 
while defending too, Australia’s 

unique cultural inheritance. The three 

tiers can neither be separated, nor 
operated one without the others. 

 
The immediate aim of the party is to 

unite all genuine nationalists into one 
organization. 

 
This has become an important task 

because of the winding-up of parties 

such as the Australians Against Fur-
ther Immigration, One Nation (New 

South Wales) and others—and the on
-going decline of the One Nation par-

ty. A new nationalist electoral and 
activist party is essential. 


